August 30, 2018 at 2:00 P.M., City Hall, Harlan, lowa SE# 02918

FACILITY IMPROVEMENTS - PHASE 1
LITTLE LEAGUE RESTROOM, PRESS BOXES, BLEACHERS
AND BACKSTOP/NETTING
J.J. JENSEN COMPLEX
DENISON, IOWA

BID SUMMARY
DIVISION 1 DIVISION 2 DIVISION 3 DIVISION 3A DIVISION 4
LITTLE LEAGE RESTROOM PRESS BOXES BLEACHER CONCRETE BLEACHERS BACKSTOP/NETTING

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: $187,725.50 $96,000.00 $20,996.00 $42,000.00 $39,651.00

BIDDER NO. 1:
LEINEN CONSTRUCTION $124,779.09 $91,309.00 $17,257.43 $32,801.00 $42,975.54
HARLAN, IOWA

BIDDER NO. 2:
BADDING CONSTRUCTION $227,057.31 $163,715.67 $44,620.65 $42,362.00 NO BID
CARROLL, [OWA

BIDDER NO. 3:
IOWA DIRECT EQUIPMENT NO BID NO BID NO BID $33,459.00 NO BID




